
Hay  treble  in  SWPL  monthly
awards
Brogan  Hay  and  Carrie  McGorm  collected  the  March
2022/23 Park’s Motor Group, Scottish Women’s Premier
League (SWPL) Player of the Month awards.
 
Hay becomes the only SWPL player to ever win the award
for a third time, the Scotland internationalist having
previously won the award for August/September 2019 and
April 2021.
 
The forward was voted by fellow clubs having scored
three goals and provided one assist in March. This
included  the  only  goals  in  their  1-0  away  win  to
Spartans  and  in  their  1-1  draw  with  Celtic.
 
Rangers went unbeaten in March, winning three of their
games before being denied all three points by a late
equaliser at home to Celtic in their final game of the
month.
 
In Park’s Motor Group SWPL 2, Carrie McGorm won the
honour for Stirling University making them the first
team in the division to have won the award twice this
season. Cyprus international, Anthina Varnava, won back
in September.
 
McGorm got both goals in their 2-1 win over Gartcairn,
including  a  spectacular  eventual  winner.  She  also
provided an assist in their 2-2 draw with East Fife.
 
Results meant that Stirling University maintained their
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eight-point lead over East Fife in the battle to avoid
automatic relegation.
 
The nominees award were Lauren Davidson (Glasgow City),
Ciara  Grant  (Heart  of  Midlothian),  and  Shen  Menglu
(Celtic) and for the SWPL 2 award the nominees were
Rebecca  Cameron  (St  Johnstone)  and  Hannah  Davie
(Boroughmuir  Thistle).


