
Final  few  Allanwater  homes
available with some extras

INCENTIVES AVAILABLE ON FINAL FEW THREE
AND  FOUR  BEDROOM  HOMES  AT  RUMBLINGWELL
   
Allanwater Homes popular Rumblingwell development, just ten
minutes  from  the  centre  of  Dunfermline,  has  incentives
available on its final three and four bedroom homes.

On offer is the three bedroom terraced, and semi-detached
Kintail villa, ideal for first time buyers, couples, and young
families,  and  priced  from  just  £162,995  for  the  terraced
design, and from £167,995 for the semi detached version.

Those in the market for a four bedroom property can opt for
the final Cuillin, priced at £239,995 and complete with a
luxury  fitted  kitchen  with  integrated  appliances.  This
property also includes a single garage and has a large south
facing garden with no properties planned to be built behind it
to obscure the views it enjoys. There is also easy access from
this property to a local cycle path.

All Allanwater Homes properties are constructed with energy
efficient  materials  to  give  reduced  running  costs  to  the
buyer. Inside and out, the properties are built with care and
attention  to  detail.  The  Allanwater  Homes  “as  standard”
specification  is  excellent,  with  a  quality  luxury  fitted
kitchen with in built appliances, superb bathroom, en-suite,
and  sanitaryware,  and  flooring  choice.  Double  glazing  and
central heating is also included, plus a full 10 year Premier
Guarantee.

Sales Advisor Pamela Dickson from Allanwater Homes said :
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“This  Rumblingwell  development  is  fulfilling  an  important
demand for new housing in this area. We are delighted to have
sold so well and to only have a few properties left for sale.
They are all well priced and well designed properties, sure to
appeal to buyers everywhere.

“The area has many schools and amenities. Please ask us about
any  incentives  we  have  on  specific  plots,  as  we  will  be
delighted to assist.”

Prospective buyers can check out the current Allanwater Home
specification by visiting the acclaimed Grampian showhome at
The  Views  at  Saline,  another  successful  Allanwater  Homes
development which is now selling from its final phase. 

For further details on Rumblingwell, Dunfermline, call Pamela
Dickson in the Marketing Suite at The Views, Saline on 07860
954077, Thursday to Monday 11.00am to 5.30pm.

Further details at www.allanwaterhomes.co.uk

The Cuillin house style
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